
 

Let us Cultivate Koinonia! 

Romans 16:14-16 

April 21, 2024 
 
 
“Greet Asyncritus, Phlegon, Hermas, Patrobas, Hermes, and the 
brethren who are with them.  Greet Philologus and Julia, Nereus and 
his sister, and Olympas, and all the saints who are with them.  Greet 
one another with a holy kiss.  The churches of Christ greet you.”  
(Romans 16:14-16; NKJ) 
 
 

1.  Let us intentionally pursue and model 
______________ in __________________! 
 
 
“Greet Asyncritus, Phlegon, Hermas, Patrobas, Hermes, and the 
brethren who are with them.”  (v14) 
 
“And let us consider one another in order to stir up love and good 
works, not forsaking the assembling of ourselves together, as is the 
manner of some, but exhorting one another, and so much the more as 
you see the Day approaching.”  (Hebrews 10:24-25; NKJ) 
 
 

2.  Let us pursue a _____________________ 

with Christ in His ______________ ! 
 
 
“Greet Philologus and Julia, Nereus and his sister, and Olympas, and 
all the saints who are with them.”  (v15) 
 
“Be diligent to present yourself approved to God, a worker who does 
not need to be ashamed, rightly dividing the word of truth.”  (2 
Timothy 2:15; NKJ) 
 
“Open my eyes, that I may see wondrous things from Your law.”  
Psalm 119:18 
 
“Oh, how I love Your law!  It is my meditation all the day.”  (Psalm 
119:97; NKJ) 
 
“Let the word of Christ dwell in you richly in all wisdom, teaching and 
admonishing one another in psalms and hymns and spiritual songs, 
singing with grace in your hearts to the Lord.”  (Colossians 3:16; NKJ) 

3.  Let us pursue and model Christ in the 

______________ of our ______________ and 
life.  
 
 
“Greet Philologus and Julia, Nereus and his sister, and Olympas, and 
all the saints who are with them.”  (v15) 
 
“Bondservants, obey in all things your masters according to the flesh, 
not with eyeservice, as men-pleasers, but in sincerity of heart, fearing 
God.  And whatever you do, do it heartily, as to the Lord and not to 
men, knowing that from the Lord you will receive the reward of the 
inheritance; for you serve the Lord Christ.”  (Colossians 3:22-24; NKJ) 
 
“All the saints greet you, but especially those who are of Caesar’s 
household.”  (Philippians 4:22; NKJ) 
 
“But sanctify the Lord God in your hearts, and always be ready to give 
a defense to everyone who asks you a reason for the hope that is in 
you, with meekness and fear;”  (1 Peter 3:15; NKJ) 
 
 

4.  Let us look for ______________ and 

______________ ways to demonstrate 

______________ in the body of Christ! 
 
 
“Greet one another with a holy kiss.  The churches of Christ greet 
you.”  (v16) 
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