
 

The Road to Resurrection – Bethany 

Matthew 26:6-15 
March 28, 2021 – Palm Sunday 
 
 
“Now it came to pass, when the time had come for Him to be received 
up, that He steadfastly set His face to go to Jerusalem,”  (Luke 9:51; 
NKJ) 
 
“And when Jesus was in Bethany at the house of Simon the leper, a 
woman came to Him having an alabaster flask of very costly fragrant 
oil, and she poured it on His head as He sat at the table.  But when His 
disciples saw it, they were indignant, saying, ‘Why this waste?  For this 
fragrant oil might have been sold for much and given to the poor.’  But 
when Jesus was aware of it, He said to them, ‘Why do you trouble the 
woman? For she has done a good work for Me.  For you have the poor 
with you always, but Me you do not have always.  For in pouring this 
fragrant oil on My body, she did it for My burial.  Assuredly, I say to 
you, wherever this gospel is preached in the whole world, what this 
woman has done will also be told as a memorial to her.’   Then one of 
the twelve, called Judas Iscariot, went to the chief priests and said, 
‘What are you willing to give me if I deliver Him to you?’ And they 
counted out to him thirty pieces of silver. So from that time he sought 
opportunity to betray Him”. (Matthew 26:6-15; NKJ) 
 
 

1.  Jesus invites you to truly and intimately 

comprehend ___________________________!   
 
 
“… a woman came to Him having an alabaster flask of very costly 
fragrant oil, and she poured it on His head as He sat at the table. …”  
(v7) 
 
“There they made Him a supper; and Martha served, but Lazarus was 
one of those who sat at the table with Him.  Then Mary took a pound 
of very costly oil of spikenard, anointed the feet of Jesus, and wiped 
His feet with her hair. …:”  (John 12:2-3; NKJ) 
 
“Then Martha, as soon as she heard that Jesus was coming, went and 
met Him, but Mary was sitting in the house. Now Martha said to Jesus, 
‘Lord, if You had been here, my brother would not have died.  But 
even now I know that whatever You ask of God, God will give You.’  
Jesus said to her, ‘Your brother will rise again.’  Martha said to Him, ‘I 
know that he will rise again in the resurrection at the last day.’  Jesus 
said to her, ‘I am the resurrection and the life. He who believes in Me, 

though he may die, he shall live.  And whoever lives and believes in 
Me shall never die. Do you believe this?’  She said to Him, ‘Yes, Lord, I 
believe that You are the Christ, the Son of God, who is to come into 
the world.’”  (John 11:21-27; NKJ) 
 
 

2.  Jesus invites you to grasp the complete 

______________ of His ______________.  
 
 
“From that time Jesus began to show to His disciples that He must go 
to Jerusalem, and suffer many things from the elders and chief priests 
and scribes, and be killed, and be raised the third day.  Then Peter 
took Him aside and began to rebuke Him, saying, ‘Far be it from You, 
Lord; this shall not happen to You!’  But He turned and said to Peter, 
‘Get behind Me, Satan! You are an offense to Me, for you are not 
mindful of the things of God, but the things of men.’”  (Matthew 
16:21-23; NKJ) 
 
“Was it not necessary and essentially fitting that the Christ (the 
Messiah) should suffer all these things before entering into His glory 
(His majesty and splendor)?”  (Luke 24:26; AMP) 
 
 

3.  Jesus invites you to ______________ Him 

with sacrificial ______________! 
 
 
“… a woman came to Him having an alabaster flask of very costly 
fragrant oil, and she poured it on His head as He sat at the table. …”  
(v7) 
 
 
“Then Mary took a pound of very costly oil of spikenard, anointed the 
feet of Jesus, and wiped His feet with her hair. And the house was 
filled with the fragrance of the oil.” (John 12:3; NKJ) 
 
 
Conclusion 
 
 
“But Jesus said, ‘Let her alone; she has kept this for the day of My 
burial.’”  (John 12:7; NKJ) 
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